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ADAPTEC® CI/O™

With easy to use Adaptec® CI/O™ software, managers can monitor 
all SCSI peripheral devices connected to servers by Adaptec® host 
adapters.  

Using Adaptec® CI/O™ software on any Windows® client, managers 
can remotely monitor the I/O performance of any server on the 
network from a single central location.  Managers can install the latest 
device drivers from a remote location as well.

Adaptec® CI/O™ software automatically detects failure of any SCSI 
device on a network server and notifies the manager immediately.  
With a clear view of I/O traffic, managers can spot bottlenecks and act 
quickly to balance I/O loads to optimize performance among SCSI 
devices.  Adaptec® CI/O™ improves the manageability of any size 
network--from a single server to a global network.

Adaptec, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2840/2VL
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-2940AU
AHA®-3940/W
AHA®-3980/5/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

NetWare 3.12+ • • ••• • • • •     
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1-800-934-2766 1-800-934-2766

408-262-2533

  691 S MILPITAS BLVD      •   MILPITAS,  CA     •    USA

sales@adaptec.comTOLL FREE

http://www.adaptec.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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SBACKUP

SBackup™ is a backup compatible SCSI tape backup software for 
QNX2. It supports DAT, 8mm and QIC format SCSI tape drives.

Florida Datamation HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

USA

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

QNX2   • •          
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(407) 241-2966 (800) 642-5938

(407) 241-3108

  AMTEC CENTER   6405 CONGRESS AVE, SUITE 140   •   BOCA RATON,  FL  33487   •    

sales@fdma.comTOLL FREEPHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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THE JUKEBOX MANAGER

The Jukebox Manager™ option for Logicraft's LanCD™ network 
server software provides a versatile solution for networked access to 
archived CD-ROM storage.  It is modular in design, hardware 
independent and non-vendor specific for jukebox support.  Features 
include Document Image Management, static directory or platter 
caching and DDC (dynamic hard disk cache), asynchronous access, 
multiple jukebox support, Intelligent Optical Reader Selection, local 
on-line management, and support for up to 1280 platters and 56 
readers per LanCD server.  With up to 10 servers per client, each user 
could have access to more than 12 thousand CD-ROM discs.

Logicraft Information Systems HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR
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603-880-0300 800-880-5644

(603) 880-7229

  22 COTTON ROAD      •   NASHUA,  NH  03063   •    

sales@logicraft.comTOLL FREE

http://www.logicraft.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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FASTCD™, LANCD

FastCD™ is an option available with Logicraft's LanCD™ networking 
software for providing multiple concurrent access to CD-ROM 
applications in a multi-platform, multi-protocol networking 
environment.  FastCD creates "virtual CD-ROM discs" on fast, high 
performance SCSI hard drives by caching the entire contents of a CD-
ROM in its native format onto a FastCD partition of the hard disk, 
providing users with easy access to their CD-ROM applications at 
hard disk speeds up to 300 times faster than standard CD-ROM 
drives.  FastCD software includes comprehensive status reports, 
multimedia support, and asynchronous disk access for higher 
throughput during multiple concurrent accessing.

Logicraft Information Systems HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR
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603-880-0300 800-880-5644

(603) 880-7229

  22 COTTON ROAD      •   NASHUA,  NH  03063   •    

sales@logicraft.comTOLL FREE

http://www.logicraft.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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CDEXECUTIVE™ CD-ROM NETWORK SERVER

The CDexecutive /XF5500 CD-ROM network server provides a 
turnkey solution for multiple concurrent accesses to CD-ROM 
applications in a multi-platform, multi-protocol environment.  The 
Pentium™ based XF hardware architecture is bundled with Logicraft's 
high performance CDexecutive Management Center software that 
automatically monitors and manages CD-ROM applications as a 
background Windows NT™ service.  Client support includes 
Windows® 95, Windows® for Workgroups, Macintosh® and 
NetWare clients.  The XF server holds up to 14 SCSI devices and 
comes equipped with IDE hard drive, network interface card, floppy 
drive and SCSI host adapters.  It runs at 120MHz, has 32MB of RAM 
and supports up to 56 SCSI devices.

Logicraft Information Systems HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR
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603-880-0300 800-880-5644

(603) 880-7229

  22 COTTON ROAD      •   NASHUA,  NH  03063   •    

sales@logicraft.comTOLL FREE

http://www.logicraft.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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LANCD™ CD-ROM NETWORK SERVERS

The LanCD/XF family of CD-ROM network servers provides a 
turnkey solution for multiple concurrent accesses to CD-ROM 
applications in a multi-platform, multi-protocol environment.  The 
Pentium™ based XF hardware architecture is bundled with Logicraft's 
high-performance LanCD and FastCD™ software that supports DOS, 
Windows® and Windows® 95 clients.  Optional support is available 
for Windows NT® and Macintosh clients.  Each chassis holds up to 14 
SCSI devices and comes equipped with IDE hard drive, network 
interface card, floppy drive and SCSI host adapters.  The XF5300 runs 
at 75MHz, has 16MB of RAM and expands to 28 drives.  The XF5500 
runs at 120MHz, has 32MB and supports up to 56 drives.

Logicraft Information Systems HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1520/2
AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR
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603-880-0300 800-880-5644

(603) 880-7229

  22 COTTON ROAD      •   NASHUA,  NH  03063   •    

sales@logicraft.comTOLL FREE

http://www.logicraft.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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T4-2600

The T4-2600 is a new 5.25" multifunction optical disk drive with 
2.6GB capacity.  It provides unlimited transportable storage at an 
excellent value, offering unparalleled reliability, a fast seek rate up to 
4.0 MB/second transfer rate and with 1 read/write cache, it delivers an 
outstanding performance.  The T4-2600 drive conforms to ISO 
specifications and accepts three ISO standard media formats - 2.6GB, 
1.3GB and 650MB.
This drive is reliable, affordable and high performance.  The media 
can be written and erased more than 10,000,000 times.

Maxoptix Corporation HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

Windows®   • •          
DOS   • •          
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(510) 353-9700 (800) 848-3092

(510) 353-1845

  3342 GATEWAY BLVD.      •   FREMONT,  CA  94538   •    USA

TOLL FREEPHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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MAXLYB

The Maxoptix MaxLyb family of optical auto changers utilizes the T4-
2600 drives to deliver high performance and reliable specifications.  
The MaxLyb family covers a wide range of capacities - 26GB to over 
600GB, which ensures the most useful library is available for a variety 
of applications.

With the MaxLyb family of optical storage libraries, Maxoptix offers 
the widest selection of optical library solutions and fills the price-
performance gaps left by other storage technologies.  With the fastest 
on-line access to stored data and information, they are the logical 
choice for those who need top performance, demonstrated reliability 
and future expandability at competitive prices.

Maxoptix Corporation HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR
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(510) 353-9700 (800) 848-3092

(510) 353-1845

  3342 GATEWAY BLVD.      •   FREMONT,  CA  94538   •    USA

TOLL FREEPHONE E-MAIL
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CD NET SOFTWARE

CD Net™ software provides shared LAN access to CD-ROMs, high 
performance, integrated data management tools, support for high-
capacity configurations, and compatibility with all published CDs.  
These features result in lower cost, increased utilization of shared CD 
resources and easy operation.  Versions available for use with Novell 
NetWare 3.12 & 4.1, Microsoft NT 3.51, Vines 4.0+, and MS-DOS 
based servers, with clients for Windows 95, Windows NT 
Workstation, Windows 3.x, MS-DOS, and Macintosh.

Meridian Data, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English, German

Canada, Europe, Far East, Pacific 
Rim, USA

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1510
AHA®-1520/2
AHA®-1530/2P
AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2825VL
AHA®-2840/2VL
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W
AHA®-3980/5/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

LanMan  •             
Macintosh 7.0+ •             
NetWare 3.11+ •             
Vines 4.0+ •             
Windows® 3.0+ •             
Windows®95  •             
Windows NT  •             
DOS 3.1+ •             
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(408) 438-3100 (800) 767-2537

(408) 438-6816

  5615 SCOTTS VALLEY DRIVE      •   SCOTTS VALLEY,  CA  95066   •    

info@meridian-data.comTOLL FREE

http://www.meridian-data.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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NETWARE

Novell’s® NetWare® network computing products manage and 
control the sharing of services, data and applications among computer 
workgroups, departmental networks and business-wide information 
systems. NetWare v4.1x provides interoperability, network services, 
high performance, reliability and security in a network operating 
system. It utilizes a 32-bit, multitasking architecture and supports 
DOS, Windows, Macintosh, OS/2 and UNIX workstations. In 
addition, NetWare v4.1x offers reliability features such as disk 
duplexing, read-after-write verfication and disk mirroring.

Novell, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English, Japanese

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2840/2VL
AHA®-2910A/Ai
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W
AHA®-3980/5/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR
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800-NETWARE 800-NETWARE

(801)861-2665

  122 EAST 1700 SOUTH      •   PROVO,  UT  84606   •    

hbasup@novell.comTOLL FREE

www.novell.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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GLOBALNET

GlobalNet™ storage servers provide Novell Network access to optical 
jukeboxes, including CD-ROM, Erasable and WORM (Write Once 
Read Many) technologies.  Notable for its ease of installation, use and 
its speed.

Optisys HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-2840/2VL
AHA®-3940/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

Windows®  •   •• •   •   •  
DOS  •   •• •   •   •  
NetWare  •   •• •   •   •  
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(602) 997-9699 (800) 327-1271

(602) 944-4051

  9250 NORTH 43RD AVENUE, SUITE 12      •   GLENDALE,  AZ  85302   •    

TOLL FREEPHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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PIONEER

Pioneer, the leading manufacturer of optical disc technology has 
developed a solution utilizing it's high storage CD-ROM autochanger.  
This solution provides stored video clips directly to designated PC's.  
The Video Browse Server enables users to view the whole of a video 
library on a PC.  This application has a user friendly and logical GUI.  
The video clips never physically leave the library, hence no time lost 
tracing material.  All of the video is held on CD-ROMs locked away in 
a 500 disk autochanger.  Initially by the use of alphanumeric entries a 
search can be narrowed down to several titles. A selected title gives 
further indexed information on the clip and also more importantly at 
least two thumbnails.  The chosen clip can then be viewed on a PC 
terminal.  By selecting various clips the user automatically generates a 
clip list.  This file can then be sent to the compiling station on the 
network.  The compiling station then assembles the request on any 
chosen broadcast medium- D1, D2, D3, D5, Digital Betacam, 
Betacam, Disc etc.

Pioneer Hi-Fi (GB) Ltd. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-2940/4/U/UW
AHA®-3940/W
AHA®-3940U/UW

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

Windows NT  • •    •   •   • •
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144-1717940888

144-01753-789539

  1 LAMBOLLE PLACE      •   LONDON,    NW34PD   •    ENGLAND

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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OPTI-NET

The OPTI-NET® product family lets users share information on CD-
ROM discs over a local area network.  Advanced performance features 
include server and workstation XMS caching and data prefetch 
coupled with sophisticated administration features such as remote 
management and license enforcement.  OPTI-NET for MS-DOS 
supports both Novell and NetBIOS LANs.  

OPTI-NET NLM allows the addition of CD-ROM drives onto a 
Novell NetWare 3.x or 4.x file server.  This NetWare Loadable 
Module (NLM), certified by Novell Labs, extends the functionality of 
the file server by enhancing the ability to manage and administer CD-
ROM drives.  This is a fast powerful solution now enhanced for CD 
jukeboxes and multilingual language support.  

OPTI-NET now provides a utility that fully automates CD-ROM 
applications for Windows clients accessing either a DOS or NLM CD-
ROM server.  After the initial installation and setup, end-users may 
launch networked CD-ROM titles by simply clicking on the desired 
program icon.

OPTI-NET's NLM version also supports the German, French, French 
Canadian and Spanish languages.

Reed Technology & Information Ser HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Canada
Germany
USA

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1520/2
AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

NetWare  •     •        
DOS  •             
LanMan  •             
Windows®  •             
Vines  •             
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(301) 428-3700 (800) 922-9204

(301) 428-2903

  20251 CENTURY BOULEVARD      •   GERMANTOWN,  MD  20874   •    

HelpDesk@ocs.comTOLL FREEPHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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TSX-32

TSX-32™ offers the power of real-time, multi-user UNIX operating 
system with the ease-of-use of DOS. It excels as an application server 
for DOS (16-bit & DPMI) and 32-bit applications, an NFS file server, 
a communication server and a printer server. TSX-32 supports up to 
256 users and 400 concurrent tasks on a single PC. Or, up to 40 times 
that number on a TCP/IP LAN or WAN. Add the BBS engine for 
advanced remote access functionality. Add full Internet connectivity. 
See the TSX-BBS also listed in this guide.

S&H Computer Systems, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English, French, German, Italian, 
Spanish

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2840/2VL
AHA®-2940/4/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

DOS   • •          
Windows®   • •          
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(615) 327-3670

(615) 321-5929

  1027 17TH AVENUE SOUTH      •   NASHVILLE,  TN  37212   •    USA

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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TSX-BBS

TSX-BBS™ serves remote access connectivity needs ranging from 
those of a 2-line entertainment BBS to those of an entire corporation. 
It features full Internet support. TSX-BBS add-ins can be standard 
DOS applications, DBMSs and tools, as well as BBS “door” 
programs. It is configured to support one SYSOP and from two to 256 
users on one PC. In addition, TSX-BBS can support hundreds of users 
spread across a TCP/IP LAN or WAN of TSX-BBS servers.

S&H Computer Systems, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English, French, German, Italian, 
Norwegian, Portuguese, Swedish, 
Spanish

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1520/2
AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2840/2VL
AHA®-2940/4/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

TSX-32 4.2 • • ••• •   • •    
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(615) 327-3670

(615) 321-5929

  1027 17TH AVENUE SOUTH      •   NASHVILLE,  TN  37212   •    USA

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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IRONCLAD

IronClad® is a highly Windows-integrated security program which 
provides comprehensive protection for both standalone and networked 
PCs.  IronClad provides both data-security (access control down to the 
file level, DES/proprietary encryption, keyboard locking, virus 
prevention, program/data auditing, boot protection, single sign-on and 
object reuse prevention) and application-security (auto application 
protection, piracy prevention, public access and file purging).

Silver Oak Systems, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Canada
Europe
USA

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1740/2/4

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

DOS  • • ••• •  •  •    
Windows®  • • ••• •  •  •    
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(301) 585-8641

(301) 588-6484

  8209 CEDAR STREET      •   SILVER SPRING,  MD  20910   •    USA

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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SOLARIS 2.5 FOR X86

Solaris leads the UNIX operating system market, running on an 
installed base of more than 2 million systems.  It is the fastest, most 
secure and reliable 32-bit operating system for SPARC, Intel, and 
Power PC server and desktop systems.

Solaris provides a foundation for highly - integrated enterprise 
network environments, supporting multi-vendor interoperability and 
resource sharing.  The operating system fits seamlessly into existing 
computing environments, providing the network management and 
configuration tools for customers' growing computing needs.

Solaris includes advanced technologies for multithreading, symmetric 
multiprocessing, integrated TCP/IP-based networking, and centralized 
network administration tools.  And, recognizing the diversity of 
customer needs, Solaris comes in a series of configurations.

SunSoft, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Worldwide

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1510
AHA®-1520/2
AHA®-1530/2P
AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2840/2VL
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-2940/4/U/UW

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

DOS   • •          
Windows®   • •          
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(415) 960-3200

(415) 336-0555

  2550 GARCIA AVENUE      •   MOUNTAIN VIEW,  CA  94043   •    USA

http://www.sun.com

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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SCSI SHUTTLE

The TAC Systems SCSI Shuttle™ product allows users to access CD-
ROMs on DOS/Windows based platforms.  Also, our Novell based 
version installs on any Netware 3.x or 4.x file server without the use of 
additional drivers or software on the workstations.

TAC Systems HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

Canada
Japan
USA

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2940/4/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

DOS  •     •        
NetWare 3.x, 4.x •    • •        
Windows®  •     •        
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(205) 721-1976

(205) 721-0242

  1031 PUTMAN DRIVE      •   HUNTSVILLE,  AL  35816   •    

PHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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SCO/OPEN DESKTOP

SCO Open Desktop combines the SCO UNIX System, an advanced 
GUI, networking, and DOS services in an integrated 32-bit, distributed 
client/server platform.  Both the SCO UNIX System and SCO Open 
Desktop deliver unprecedented multi-user, multitasking performance 
on today's 386/486 ISA, EISA, Micro Channel, and multiprocessor 
systems (with SCO MPX).

The Santa Cruz Operation, Inc. HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

USA

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1510
AHA®-1520/2
AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1640
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

DOS   • •          
Windows®   • •          
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(408) 425-7222 (800) SCO-UNIX

(408) 427-5432
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TOLL FREEPHONE E-MAIL

FAX URL
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THEOS NETSERVER

THEOS NetServer® is a network operating system that integrates 
THEOS-based applications seamlessly with Novell and Microsoft 
platforms, including Windows for Workgroups 3.11, Windows 95 and 
Windows NT.  As a dedicated application server, NetServer can 
support a mixed Client/Server environment of terminals and graphics 
workstations, offering centralized data security and fast file access.

The THEOS operating system is primarily used in vertical markets 
such as Dental, Veterinarian, Alarm Systems and Point-of-Sale.

THEOS Software Corporation HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English, French, German, Italian, 
Portuguese, Spanish

France
Germany
Italy
Spain

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

THEOS NetS   • •     •  • •  
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(510) 935-1118 800-600-5660

(510) 935-1177
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info@theos-software.comTOLL FREE

http://www.theos-software.com
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THEOS 32

THEOS 32® is a 32-bit multiuser, multi-threaded, preemptive 
multitasking operating system.  Optimized to run on 486 and Pentium 
based systems, THEOS can support over 200 users.  Built-in features 
include:  Windowing capabilities, RS-232 Communications tools, 
Tape Backup Utilities, SCSI support.  Additional products include 32-
bit C and BASIC development languages.

The THEOS operating system is primarily used in vertical markets 
such as Dental, Veterinarian,  Alarm Systems and Point-of-Sale.

THEOS Software Corporation HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English, French, German, Italian, 
Portuguese, Spanish

France
Germany
Italy
Spain

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

THEOS 32   • •     •  • •  
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(510) 935-1177
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NETSERVER

NetServer software connects storage and peripheral resources to 
TCP/IP-NFS networks quickly, easily, and economically.  NetServer 
based NFS file servers provide local and remote tape backup, rapid-
restart file volumes, and local and remote menu-driven administration.  
The streamlined firmware-like design manages terabytes of storage 
and delivers 1000+ SPEC-NFS operations per second.  NetServer is 
available to qualified VARS/OEMS/ Integrators that service the Open 
Systems Market.

Traakan HOST ADAPTERS TESTED

Tape M-O WORM DAT Jukebox Floptical Multifunction Disk Array Scanner Printer

 LANGUAGE(S) SUPPORTED

 PRODUCTS AVAILABLE IN

English

USA, United Kingdom

PERIPHERALS SUPPORTED

CD-ROM

AHA®-1540/2/F/P
AHA®-1740/2/4
AHA®-2740/2/4/T/W
AHA®-2940/4/W
AHA®-3940/W

Disk/Hard Drive CDR

NetServer  • • •  •   •  •   
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415-961-0900

415-941-0914

  111 MAIN STREET   SUITE 5   •   LOS ALTOS,  CA  94022   •    
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